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Disclaimer 

 

This e-book has been written for information purposes only. Every 
effort has been made to make this e-book as complete and accurate as 

possible. 

 
However, there may be mistakes in typography or content. Also, this 

e-book provides information only up to the publishing date. Therefore, 

this e-book should be used as a guide - not as the ultimate source. 

The purpose of this e-book is to educate. The author and the publisher 

does not warrant that the information contained in this e-book is fully 

complete and shall not be responsible for any errors or omissions. 
 

The author and publisher shall have neither liability nor responsibility 

to any person or entity with respect to any loss or damage caused or 
alleged to be caused directly or indirectly by this e-book. 
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Introduction 
____________________________________ 

 

 
 

Each day, a large number of individuals use the internet.  
 

Many of those individuals are looking for ways to make money online. 

The only problem with using the internet to research money making 
opportunities is that there are a large number of online scams. 

 

These scams many not only dash your homes of making money online, 
but they may also leave you broke. That is why it is important that you 

fully understand each online money-making opportunity before 

investing or signing a contract. 
 

As previously mentioned, a large number of individuals use the 

internet to search for money making ideas and opportunities. In fact, 
there are so many individuals doing this that there is a good chance 

that you are one of them. 

 
In your search, you may have come across an opportunity claiming 

that you can make money by reselling private label products. The good 

news about these opportunities is that, in most cases, they are a 
legitimate. The bad news is that many of these offers rarely go into 
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detail. This means that you may not even know what you are getting 
or what you are supposed to do to make money. 

 

When it comes to making money online, there are many individuals 
who move on to the next opportunity when they do not fully 

understand how one works. 

 
If you do this with private label reselling, you may be missing out on 

the opportunity of a lifetime.  Instead of moving on to the next 

money-making opportunity, you are advised to learn as much as you 
can about private label resell rights. 

 

After you have familiarized yourself with this amazing opportunity, you 
may very well find that it is a great way to make money. 

 

Private label resell products cover a wide variety of different things.  
Online, you will find that most of these products include software 

programs, e-books, articles, and source codes. 

 
These are products are popular because they are high in demand.  For 

instance, many webmasters use articles to increase the content on 

their website. Software programs are increasing in popularity as more 
businesses make the decision to be unified, computer wise. 

 

E-books are rapidly increasing in popularity, especially as more 
individuals are finding them cheaper than printed books. Source codes, 

similar to html codes, are essential to the development of online 

websites.   
 

While e-books, software programs, and content articles are needed, as 
detailed above, there are many individuals who do not have the time 

or the necessary skills to develop their own programs or content.  

Instead, they often hire professional assistance. 
 

The only problem with professional assistance is that it is often 

expensive. A professional writer or software developer can charge as 
much as they want for their services and many of them charge large 

amounts. 
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Instead, individuals and businesses, in need of software or content, 
look for cheaper alternatives. One of those alternatives may involve 

purchasing a product from you. 

 
Private label software programs, content articles, and e-books are 

often developed by experienced professionals. The only problem is that 

many of these individuals do not have the time or the experience 
needed to market their products to the public. 

 

Without proper marketing, there is a good chance their product will 
never sell.  So, instead of marketing their products, private label 

product creators will then up and sell the rights to their product.   

 
However, the money-making opportunity is when you are granted 

resell rights. Resell rights mean that you can resell the products that 

you just purchased, often for any price that you want.  
 

What does this mean for you? This means that, for a reasonable price, 

you should not only be able to purchase a software program, and e-
book, or content articles, but you are also purchasing the rights to 

resell these products. 

 
So, in a way, you will be making money without having to do any 

work.  Sound impossible doesn’t it? Honestly, it is not. As long as you 

are able to find a reliable and trustworthy software developer or writer 
to business with, you will be participating in a legitimate business 

opportunity. 

 
If this opportunity sounds like something you would be interested in, 

you are advised to get searching. Online, you will find a number of 
these private label resell opportunities. 

 

With a little bit of time and research you could find the perfect product 
and then you could be on your way to making money, all the while 

sitting from the comfort of your own home. 

 
 

  

 
 

 



PLR Influence 

8 
 

Chapter 1: Buying PLR Versus 
Writing Your Own 
____________________________________ 

 

 
 

In today’s society, there are many individuals who are looking 
to make money anyway that they can. 

 
In many cases, these individuals are looking for opportunities that 

allow them to work at their own pace or be their own boss. If you are 

one of those individuals then it is possible that you may have thought 
about creating and selling e-books. 

 

The popularity of e-books has rapidly increased over the past few 
years now. Many readers are not only finding it convenient to purchase 

them, but cheaper. In most cases, e-books are easily to read on the 

computer, but they can also be printed off. 
 

Since more and more consumers are interested in purchasing e-books, 

there are more individuals who are looking to make money off of 
them. If you are able to do this, you may find success; however, that 

success will not come without hard work. 
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If you have never created an e-book before, it is difficult to understand 
exactly how much hard work it entails. To be worth the buy, most e-

books are at least one hundred pages long; however, some are longer.   

 
If you are interested in creating an e-book, it may take months for you 

to finish the book. In addition to hard work, you must also have 

writing experience and knowledge on the topic that you are writing 
about. 

 

This knowledge and experience aren’t necessarily necessary; however, 
it is important to the success of your e-book.  It is a fact that 

customers do not and will not purchase poor quality work.   

 
In addition to writing a quality e-book, you will also have to find ways 

to sell it. Together, the two could take a large amount of time. For 

many individuals, this is a major turn off; however, there are 
alternatives. 

 

If you are interested in selling e-books, to make a profit, you do not 
necessarily have to create your own.  Instead you can obtain the 

private label resell rights to another e-book. 

 
Obtaining the resell rights to an e-book will allow you, in many cases, 

to assume to the work as your own, edit the content, and pocket the 

money from each sale of the book. 
 

The biggest downside to obtaining the resell rights to an e-book is the 

amount of money that you will have to spend. Depending on who you 
do business with, the cost of acquiring private label resell rights may 

be fairly expensive. 
 

Since most freelance writers spend a large amount of time creating 

their e-books, as previously mentioned, they may want to 
appropriately be compensated. The cost of resell rights to an e-book 

may be considered a disadvantage to this unique business opportunity, 

but it can also be considered an advantage. 
 

E-book authors that charge more for their work typically have 

produced better content; better content is easier to sell. 
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Whether you make the decision to develop your own e-book or 
purchase the resell rights to someone else’s, you will still have to find 

a way to market the e-book to the general public. This, depending on 

what approach you take, can take time. 
 

That is why many individuals prefer purchasing the resell rights to an 

e-book that has already been created. This allows them to spend more 
time on marketing, which will in turn create sales.   

 

If you are unsure as to whether or not you should create your own e-
book or obtain the resell rights to another, you are not alone. There 

are a number of other individuals wondering the same thing. Private 

label resell rights are an amazing business opportunity for some, but 
not for all. 

 

There is a great free audio course on private label resell rights at 
www.plrtips.com check this out today. All online business opportunities 

take time to find success. 

 
If you have the financial resources needed to obtain the resell rights to 

a well written e-book, you are encouraged to give this opportunity a 

shot. You are not guaranteed results, but you may be surprised with 
what you find.   

 

If you try obtaining the resell rights to an e-book and the experience is 
not what you had in mind you can begin to create your own e-books or 

move onto another business opportunity. 

 
Unlike many other business ventures, private label resell rights allow 

you to get out when you want. After you have paid for the resell rights 
to an e-book, it is yours to do with. This means that you can stop at 

any time and move on to something else, if you desire. 

 
 

Making Money With PLR Without Endless Hours Of 

Work 
 

In the United States, a large percentage of the population is employed.  

If you are one of those individuals, you likely already know how 
difficult it can be to make money. However, many workers aren’t just 
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making money for the fun of it; many have to financially support 
themselves or a family. 

 

Unfortunately, most jobs require hard work and long hours. You may 
find that your current job is taking important things away from your 

life, mostly your time. Instead of learning to manage this unfortunate 

occurrence, you are advised to do something about it. You can easily 
find another way to make money. 

 

When it comes to making money, there are many individuals who flock 
to the internet. Online you will literally find an unlimited number of 

business opportunities. 

 
Many of these opportunities promise you unlimited income with little or 

no work. While many of these business opportunities can be 

considered scams, there are some that are legitimate. 
 

One of those legitimate opportunities involves acquiring the private 

label resell rights to a particular product. After you have acquired the 
resell rights, it will then be your reasonability to sell the product. 

 

One of the many reasons why obtaining the resell rights and then 
selling a private label product is so nice is because you do not have to 

do most of the work. 

 
For instance, if you purchase the resell rights to an e-book or a 

software program, you will not have to create the e-book or software 

program. This is ideal because the development of these products not 
only takes time, but special talent or skill. Private label resell rights 

allow you to skip the hard work and concentrate on selling the 
product. 

 

One of the most common questions asked, when it comes to private 
label resell rights, is why the original author or developer can’t sell 

their own work. The reality is that they can; however, most choose not 

to. 
 

For many professional writers or software designers, they make most 

of their money when they are creating a new product. This means that 
many like to focus solely on doing that. In turn, they will rely on 

someone else to get their products to potential customers.   
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Selling a product, which you have acquired the resell rights to, often 

sounds like a commission-based program. These types of programs 

are available, but that is not how private label resell rights work. 
 

You will outright pay, the author, developer, or anyone else who is 

selling their product, for the rights to resell it. This means that any 
money you acquire from the sale, of an e-book or software program, 

you can keep. 

 
To make money off of this opportunity, you will have to sell the 

product that you have. This is where the work will come in, but it is 

not what you may expect. Since you will be working as your own boss 
and you will be in control of the money that you want to make.   

 

Therefore, you can choose your own hours. Many resell right owners 
spend most of their time advertising or marketing their product to the 

general public. This marketing may take time, but you can also look 

for quick methods of selling. These methods may include, but are not 
limited to, standard websites with quick checkouts or online auction 

sites. 

 
As you can easily see, there are a number of benefits to acquiring the 

resell rights to a private label product, such as an e-book, mass 

collection of articles, or a software program. 
 

Not only can you make money, but you can also decide how much or 

how little time you want to work. What could be better than that? 
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Chapter 2: Make Money By 
Creating Private Label Products 

____________________________________ 

 

 
 
Each day, a large number of individuals search for products 

rights that are for sale.  

 
Those individuals are looking for a product that they can resell to 

make money. Private label resell rights are a “hot” business 
opportunity right now. This is because they allow others to make 

money selling a product that they didn’t even create.   

 
A lot of focus is put on the reselling of private label products, but what 

slips the mind of many individuals is how those products are created. 

The reality is that these products are created by real people, someone 
like you. 

 

What does this mean for you? This means that if you have a special 
talent or skill, you could capitalize on that talent, especially if you have 

experience as a freelance writer or a freelance software developer. 

 
If you are interested in making money, by creating private label 

products, you will need to create a product that will sell. To find this 
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product, you may need to do a little bit of research. The goal of your 
research should be to find a niche that people are in need of. You can 

easily do this by using the internet to your advantage. 

 
A large number of individuals and companies advertise or ask about a 

particular product or product line. If you are able to create what they 

are looking for, you can be well on your way to making money. 
 

Once you have created a product that is in demand, whether that 

product be a collection of articles, an e-book, or a software program, 
you will want to advertise that the resell rights for that product are for 

sale. 

 
Most individuals do that by creating a webpage. Your webpage could 

be simple or elaborate; however, you want it to be. After time, 

prospective buyers will flock to your website wanting to purchase the 
resell rights to your product. 

 

Before you can sell the resell rights, you will need to be prepared to 
answer a few questions from prospective buyers. These questions may 

range from the price of you resell rights to information on the product 

that you have. 
 

Before you place the resell rights to your product for sale, there are a 

number of important things that you may want to take into 
consideration. There are many private label product creators that 

require their buyers to sign a contract or at least acknowledge an 

agreement. 
 

Some of these contracts and agreements limit the ways that the 
product can be altered, advertised, or how much it can sell for. While 

there are benefits to creating a user agreement, one is not required.  

You will need to decide, ahead of time, whether or not you will have 
these restrictions. 

 

One of the most common questioned asked, concerning the creation of 
private label products is why not just sell them yourself? Of course, 

you can market and sell your own product if you want to, but it may 

take a large amount of time and maybe even money. That is why 
many individuals prefer to sell the resell rights to their product. By 
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selling the rights to your product, you are able to profit from your 
creation without doing any additional work. 

 

There have been a number of different freelance writers and freelance 
software designers who have found success by creating products and 

then offering their resale rights for sale. With a little bit of hard work 

and determination, you could find that same success. 
 

 

Make Money Selling Products That You Didn’t Even 

Create 
 

There are many individuals who are misinformed when it comes to 

making money online. Unfortunately, a large number of individuals 

believe that you have to be trained in a particular field or have special 

talents. 

 

The reality is that skills and training may increase your chances of 

finding a legitimate money-making opportunity; however, they are not 

required. All you need to do is find an opportunity that requires little or 

no work and then you could be on your way to making money. 

 

An opportunity that requires little or no work; if you are wondering 

how this is possible you are not alone.  Most individuals are taught to 

beware of these business opportunities because most of them are 

scams. 

 

While you will find scams online, there real business opportunities out 

there that would not require you to put in long work hours. One of 

those business opportunities involves selling a product that isn’t even 

yours. 

 

You can do this by acquiring the private label resell rights for a 

particular product. These products are most commonly e-books, 

software programs, and content articles. 

 

The first step in taking part in this amazing business opportunity is to 

find a private label product that currently has resell rights available for 
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sale. This can easily be done a number of different ways. Perhaps, the 

easiest way is to perform a standard internet search. 

 

If you are interested in purchasing the resell rights to an e-book, you 

will want to perform a standard internet search, using the words 

private label e-book resell rights. 

 

If you are looking to purchase content articles, software programs, or 

something else, you will need to replace the word e-book with what 

you are searching for. By performing this internet search, you should 

be provided with links to websites offering resell rights for sale. 

 

An alternative to performing your own research is to seek 

recommendations from those that you know.  If you know of anyone 

who has participated in this money-making opportunity, you may want 

to ask them for advice. 

 

While product recommendations are good, it is still advised that you 

closely examine each product offer before making a final decision. If 

you do not know anyone who has participated in this type of 

opportunity, you can easily speak to those that you do not know. 

 

What is nice about the internet is that it allows you to connect with a 

wide variety of different people. These people may be able to offer 

advice or inside tips when it comes to obtaining the resell rights to a 

particular private label product. 

  

Once you have found an individual who is offering their product for 

sale, via private label resell rights, you will need to consider their 

product. You will want to make sure that it is not only a quality 

product, but one that you will be able to sell. 

 

This is important because you will be buying the right to resell the 

product. Since you will be investing your own money into this business 

opportunity, you will need to make sure that you are successful. 

 



PLR Influence 

17 
 

If you are absolutely sure that you have found a quality product that 

you can market and sell to the general public, you can go ahead and 

strike a deal with the product creator.   

 

Although obtaining the resell rights to a product, such as an e-book, 

software program, or collection of content articles, will not require a 

large amount of work on your part, it is important to remember that 

you will have to do some work. 

 

To effectively sell the product which you acquired the rights to, you 

will need to market your product to the general public. Of course, 

unless otherwise stated in your resell rights agreement, you should be 

marketing the product in any way that you see fit. 

 

In other words, this means that you should still be able to make 

money no matter how much or how little you want to work. 
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Chapter 3: Retired? Make 
Money Selling PLR EBooks 

____________________________________ 

 

 
 
In the United States, many individuals and families experience 

financial difficultly. 

 
In recent years, that difficultly has reached an all-time high. Souring 

gas prices have not only had an impact on consumers, but product 

manufacturers and retail stores as well. 
 

The increase in gas prices has caused an increase in many other 

necessities, including food.  Everyone is at risk for financial difficultly; 
however, there is one group that stands apart from the rest. That 

group is retirees.   

 
The rising prices have caused a problem for many retirees, especially 

those that had their finances planned in advance. There are many 

retirees who are now finding that they are financially unable to 
survive, if not now than in the future. 

 

This problem is becoming so wide spread that you may even be 
experiencing it.  Whether you are a recent retiree or you have been 
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retired for a while now, you may want to think about supplementing 
your income, just in case. 

 

The problem that many retirees have is going back to work. After a 
lifetime of hard work, you deserve to enjoy your newly discovered 

freedom; however, it is also important to make sure that you can 

afford that freedom. 
 

If you are interested in supplementing your income, but not by 

working as hard as you did in the past, you will find that you have a 
number of different opportunities. One of those opportunities involves 

selling e-books that you didn’t even create. 

 
If you are wondering how you could legally sell something that does 

not belong to you, you are not alone. There are a large number of 

retirees who have come across this business opportunity only to 
confuse it as a scam. The truth is that it is not a scam. 

 

You can, legally, sell e-books that you did not create by obtaining the 
resell rights from the original author. What is even more interesting is 

that you may even be able to claim yourself as the owner or the 

author of the e-book. This process is often referred to as obtaining 
private label resell rights. 

 

When it comes to private label resell rights, for e-books, there are 
many retirees who wonder what they have to do. The answer is 

simple; you can do as little or as much as you want. The first step in 

getting started is to find an individual who is selling the private label 
resell rights to their e-book. 

 
You can easily find a number of these offers by performing a standard 

internet search. You are advised to fully examine each offer that you 

come across. This is important because you will want to obtain the 
resell rights of an e-book that will successfully sell. 

 

Once you have examined all of your options, you will want to make 
contact with the individual who is offering the resell rights for sale. In 

most cases, this individual is the original author of the e-book. 

 
You will then need to reach an agreement. This agreement should 

detail how much you will need to pay to obtain the private label resell 
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rights for their book. The amount of money you will pay will all depend 
on the person or company you are doing business with.   

 

While the amount of money you will have to pay for the resell rights to 
an e-book will depend on the seller, the amount of money you will 

make will all depend on you. 

 
To sell the e-book, that you have properly acquired the rights to, you 

will need to advertise the book and market it to prospective buyers. 

You may find luck developing your own website or by selling the book 
through an online auction website. 

 

What is nice about these methods is that you can do them in your 
spare time. That means that you do not have to work fulltime, unless 

you want to. 

 
By keeping the above-mentioned points in mind, you should be able to 

make money by selling e-books.  As previously mentioned, it is 

important that you acquire the private label resell rights to a well 
written e-book. 

 

Even if you plan on altering some of the content, it is important to 
remember that you paid for it; therefore, it should be the best. 

 

 

Retired? Make Money Selling PLR Software 
 

Due to unexpected events and unforeseen circumstance, there are 

many retirees who need to return to work. For most, returning to work 
is vital to their ability to financially support themselves. 

 

Unfortunately, many retirees are limited on their ability to perform 

certain tasks, such as working long hour or lifting heavy materials. 

This leaves many retirees looking for additional ways to make money.  

 
If you are one of those individuals, you are urged to examine how you 

can make money selling software programs, ones that you didn’t even 

create. 
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If you are interested in selling software programs, especially ones that 
you do not have to create on your own, you need to find a product to 

sell. This can easily be done by searching for software designers or 

developers, especially those who are selling the resells rights to their 
products. 

 

In most cases, these individuals make most of their money when they 
are creating new products. This means that many professional 

software developers and designers do not have the time needed to 

market and sell all of their products; therefore, they place their 
product’s resell rights up for sale. 

 

If you are able to invest a few hundred dollars, the average cost to 
purchase the resell rights, you may end up finding success with this 

popular, but unique business opportunity. 

 
Once you have officially obtained the resell rights to a software 

program, you should receive a detailed list of directions from the 

seller. This list often includes rules or restrictions that they have 
placed on their product. 

 

These restrictions may require you to alter the software program in a 
small way. In most cases, this alternation will allow you to then claim 

the product as your own, thus working out well for everyone involved. 

 
After you are legally able to sell the software program, which you have 

obtained the resell rights to, you will have a number of different 

options. 
 

The selling options you choose should all depend on how much time 
and money you are able to put into this project. As previously 

mentioned, many retirees return to work because they are no longer 

are able to financially support themselves. 
 

If this is the case, you may be unable to afford expensive selling 

methods and advertising costs; however, there are a number of 
alternatives that you can use. These alternatives include the use of 

online classified ads and the creation of your own website.  

 
Online classified ads are a great way to let the public know that you 

have a software program that is available for sale. The best part about 
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these classified ads is that most are free. This means that you may not 
only be able to reach your target market, but actually make sales 

without spending dime. Although online classified ads are a great way 

to sell your software program, this selling method should be used in 
conjunction with other methods. 

 

You should also be able to sell your newly acquired software program 
by creating your own website. Perhaps, the hardest part of this selling 

method is getting your website up and running, but after that it as 

easy as selling could be. 
 

After time, you will find that customers will automatically make their 

way to your website.  If your setup an online shopping cart, your 
product can sell when you are taking a nap, on vacation, or grocery 

shopping. 

 
If buying the resell rights to private label software programs seems 

like an opportunity that you would like to be a part of, you are advised 

to act fast. Your retirement years should be some of the best. 
 

You should be able to enjoy those years without having to work. The 

quicker you get started on this amazing opportunity, the quicker you 
will make money, and the sooner you can start to fully enjoy your 

retirement. 
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Chapter 4: Your Selling Options 
With PLR 

____________________________________ 

 

 
 

Over the past few years, a number of new business 
opportunities have started appearing all over the internet. 

 

One of those opportunities involves the buying of private label resell 
rights.  By agreeing to purchase the resell rights to a particular 

product, you will be able to profit from the sale of it. 

 
Unfortunately, there are many individuals who end up losing money on 

this opportunity because they were unable to generate enough sales. 

 

If you are interested in purchasing the resell rights to a particular 

product, it is advised that you have a plan first. Many individuals get 

into trouble, by losing money, because they entered into this 
opportunity not fully understanding what was required of them.  

 

To make money from acquiring the resell rights to a product, you will 
need to sell that product. Whenever you make a sale, you will begin to 

see a profit. However, for many individuals, making a sale isn’t as 

easy as it sounds. 
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When it comes to selling a product, whether that product was obtained 

through private label resell rights or not, you need to find effective 

marketing strategies and selling methods. 
 

These methods may include the use of online classified ads, the use of 

online auction websites, or the development of a product website. 
Before deciding on a particular selling method, you are advised to 

examine the advantages and disadvantages of each. 

 
This is important because different selling methods work different 

ways for different individuals and products, no two have the same 

results. 
 

Classified ads can be used to sell a product, which you have obtained 

the resell rights to. With classified ads, your best bet is to use online 
advertisements. Most private label products are designed with internet 

users in mind; therefore, it only makes sense that you should use the 

internet to target these individuals. 
 

When examining online classified ads, you will find that most are free 

to post; however, not all are. You will need to decide whether you 
want to pay for a service that you can obtain for free somewhere else. 

 

Another popular selling method is to create your own website. This 
website should be used to outline the product which you are selling 

and the cost of it 

 
 Even if you do not know how to design your own website, you should 

be able to take part in this popular and effective selling method.  
Professional website developers can create a professional website, for 

a small fee, or you can build your own website, with the assistance of 

a site builder. 
 

It is also important that you add a shopping cart to your site. This 

shopping cart will enable your customers to purchase your product 
online. 

 

You can also use an online auction website to sell your product. Online 
auction websites will give your product the opportunity to be viewed 

by thousands, if not millions, of consumers. 
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The only problem with online auction websites is that more and more 

individuals are using this selling method to sell products, which they 

have acquired the resell rights to. This competition may make it 
difficult or impossible for your product to sell. 

 

The above-mentioned selling methods are just a few of the many that 
you can use. 

 

In fact, you are urged to use as many different selling methods as you 
can. The more exposure your product gets, the more likely it will be to 

sell. 

 
 

What You Need to Know About PLR 
 

If you are looking for ways to make money online, you are not alone. 
Each day, there are many individuals, just like you, who are searching 

for money making opportunities. 

 
While you would assume that this competition would have a negative 

effect on you being able to find work, it doesn’t always. While there 

are millions of Americans looking for these opportunities, there are 
also the same number of opportunities available; however, not all of 

them can be considered amazing. 

 
Each year, a number of hardworking Americans are scammed out of 

thousands of dollars; don’t let yourself be one of them. If you are 

looking to make money online, you will have to do a little bit of 
research. 

 

This research is essential to finding the perfect business opportunity, 

especially one that is legitimate. While this research may be time 

consuming, it is important. Not only will fully researching and 

examining all of your available business opportunities ensure that you 
will make money, but it will also protect you from being scammed. 

 

As previously mentioned, there are a number of different money-
making opportunities that can be found online. One of those 

opportunities involves acquiring the resell rights to private label 
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products. These products are most commonly e-books, content 
articles, and software programs. The process generally begins with a 

professional writer or software developer. 

 
Those professional will create a product that they feel will be useful to 

others. The only problem is that many times these professionals do 

not have time to approach prospective buyers or advertise their 
products. 

 

Therefore, instead of selling to their products to new customers, they 
sell their products to others looking to make money. 

 

If you are able to obtain the resell rights to a private label software 
program, e-book, or collection of content articles, you will then need to 

sell them. This where the money-making opportunity comes in. It will 

be your responsibility to ensure that the product sells. 
 

Once you have paid to obtain the resell rights to the product in 

question, you will then be able to collect the profits from each sale. If 
you make enough sales, you can easily replace what you originally 

paid for the resell rights.   

 
Buying the resell rights to private label products is an amazing and 

potentially money-making business opportunity. However, like all 

other business opportunities there are some things that you need to 
be on the lookout for. With acquiring the right to resell private label 

products; you need to be careful who you do business with. 

 
There are a large number of individuals who can quickly write an e-

book or develop a software program, but that does not mean the 
products are perfect. Before agreeing to acquire the resell rights to a 

particular product, you are encouraged to request detailed samples. 

This will help to ensure that you will be purchasing the resell rights to 
a quality product.   

 

If you are required to sign a contract, it is advised that you examine 
that contract and look for anything that stands out. There are a large 

number of professional software developers and freelance writers that 

have stipulations on how their products can be used. 
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Even though you are obtaining the right to resell their product, you 
must still abide by these stipulations. Each professional will likely 

develop their own, unique rules and restrictions. You are advised to 

watch out for advertising restrictions, price restrictions, and other 
similar restrictions. 

 

These restrictions may prevent you from using a certain advertisement 
method or selling the product for a certain amount of money.  These 

restrictions may turn, an otherwise money-making opportunity, into a 

financial trap.   
 

By keeping the above-mentioned points in mind, you may be able to 

turn a profit by acquiring the resell rights to a particular product. You 
can get some great insights by going to www.plrtips.com where you 

can download a free 2-hour audio PLR course on this subject. 

 
While it is possible to find a number of different products with them 

resell rights for sale, the most profitable ones tend to be e-books, 

software programs, and content articles. If you are able to acquire 
these rights and effectively market the product, you may end up 

making money in no time at all. 
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Chapter 5: The Advantages and 
Disadvantages of PLR Products 

____________________________________ 

 

 
 

At any given moment in time, there are a number of individuals 

who are searching the internet in hopes of finding a legitimate 

money-making opportunity. 

 

Many of those individuals are at-home parents, others are retired, and 

some just want to find a better opportunity. If you are interested in 

making money, in a relatively easy way, you are advised to further 

examine private label resell rights. It may very well be the opportunity 

that you have been searching for. 

 

Private label resell rights are typically offered by the product’s creator.  

Although these individuals may have the time and the knowledge 

needed to create new products, most do not have the time or the 

knowledge to sell those products. 

 

Instead of selling their own products, many rely on others to do the 

selling for them. When you obtain the resell rights to a private label 

product, you are buying the rights to resell that product. These 
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products most commonly include software programs and e-books, but 

they are not limited to just those products. 

 

After the transaction has taken place, you will then be responsible for 

selling the product. In fact, you will make money from each sale that 

you successfully process.   

 

If obtaining the private label resell rights to a particular product 

sounds like an amazing business opportunity, you may be right.   

 

However, with all other business opportunities, it is important to 

remember one thing; not all opportunities work for everyone. This 

means that although someone you know may be able to turn a profit 

buying the resell rights to an e-book or a software program, you may 

not necessarily be able to. 

 

Before investing in a private label product, not matter what that 

product is, you are encouraged to familiarize yourself with the 

advantages and disadvantages of private label resell rights. 

 

This step is important to determining whether or not this business 

opportunity can help you make money online. 

 

The biggest advantage to private label rights is that you get to make 

money selling a product that you didn’t even create. In some cases, 

you are even allowed, and maybe even required, to alter the work, but 

then you can claim it as your own. 

 

This means that overnight you literally could become a freelance writer 

or a software developer.  

 

Another advantage to private label rights it the flexibility you will have.  

Each time you sell the product, which you have acquired the resell 

rights you, you will make money. The amount of money you make will 

all depend on how many hours you work. 
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These hours could be as much or as little as you want.  In fact, many 

private labels resell buyers are able to make money selling their 

products with only working a few hours a week.   

 

While there are advantages to obtaining the resell rights to a private 

label product, there are disadvantages as well. To make money, you 

must able to find a product that will sell. 

 

Unfortunately, too many resell right buyers do not research a product 

before buying it. Those individuals usually end up losing money 

because they purchased a product that was poor in quality or one that 

couldn’t sell. Of course, this disadvantage doesn’t have to be one. All 

you need to do is research each product before agreeing to purchase 

it. This research should enable to make money, not lose it. 

 

The above-mentioned advantages and disadvantage, to buying private 

label resell rights, are just a few of the many. Despite the fact that 

there are additional advantages and disadvantages, most people find 

that the advantages outweigh the disadvantages; thus, making this a 

profitable business venture.    
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Chapter 6: Stay at Home Moms 
- Make Money by Selling PLR 

Ebooks 

____________________________________ 

 

 
 

As childcare becomes difficult to afford, there are many parents 
who are making the decision to stay at home with their 

children. 
 

In most cases, it is the mother that chooses to be the fulltime parent. 

If this situation sounds alto familiar, you may be experiencing a 
problem that many others also are. That problem is limited income.   

 

Unfortunately, it is difficult for many families to adjust to having only 
one income, especially when both parents were working.  Instead of 

relying on only one income, you are encouraged to search for easy 

ways to make money. 
 

When searching for easy ways to make money, there are a number of 

things that you have to be on the lookout for. There are a large 
number of internet scams. These scams often entice you to pay money 

to learn the secrets of making money. 
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These offers are not business opportunities, instead most are scams.  

If you are interested in participating in a real business opportunity, 

you are urged to examine private label resell rights, especially those 
for e-books. You may very well find that this is the opportunity that 

you were looking for. 

 
In the United States and all around the world, there are a number of 

individuals who have a knack for writing. Many of these individuals 

become professional freelance writers. Professional freelance writers 
create content and then try and sell it to prospective clients. 

 

However, many writers have a talent for writing, but not all have a 
talent for marketing. In fact, many freelance writers end up creating 

content, such as e-books, and then keeping them because they 

couldn’t find a buyer. 
 

This not only wastes their time, but it also causes them to lose money. 

This is where you could come in. 
 

To prevent themselves from losing money, many freelance writers are 

making the decision to offer their e-books available for sale. This sale 
is not a traditional sale. Instead, they are selling the resell rights. This 

means that they are looking for someone to sell their e-book for them.  

 
In addition to selling their own creation, there are many freelance 

writers that will allow you to claim rights to their e-books. In a way, 

that means that you will be listed as the author. 
 

However, to do this, you may need to make a few changes. These 
changes will be stipulated by the writer, but most only require the 

changing of a few sentences.  

 
If you are able to obtain the resell rights to a quality e-book, especially 

one that is on an in-demand topic, you may be able to make a fairly 

large amount of money. 
 

Each time you successful sell the e-book, you be able to pocket the 

money yourself. The cost of obtaining e-book resell rights will vary.  
Many professional freelance writers have their own ways for 

determining how much them resell rights will cost. Despite the varied 
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costs, you may find that the resell rights pay for themselves. The more 
e-books you are able to sell, the more money you will make.  

 

The amount of time and effort you put into selling the e-book, which 
you acquired the resell rights to, will vary. That is what is nice about 

this type of business opportunity. You could work as little or as much 

as you would like. You do not have to have a set schedule. 
 

As a stay at home mom, you may find this to be an amazing 

opportunity. Most of the other business opportunities available require 
long hours and loads of work. By purchasing private label resell rights 

to an e-book, you will be able to work when you want and where you 

want. 
 

This will not only allow you to control how much money you will make, 

but also how much time you are able to spend with your children. 
 

As previously mentioned, you can make money by selling the e-book, 

which you required the rights to, anyway that you want. 
 

Many stays at home moms have found success by creating their own 

websites, by advertising in online classifieds, by partnering with an 
existing website, or by placing their e-books for sale on online auction 

websites. 

 
Whether you choose one of these methods or all of them, you should 

be able to make a decent, full or part-time income. You can easily 

achieve this just by purchasing the private label resell rights to an 
interesting and well written e-book. 

 
 

Stay at Home Moms - Make Money Selling PLR 

Software 
 

There are millions of mothers who consider becoming stay at home 

moms. Unfortunately, many of those mothers do not take action. 

There are a number of different reasons for that, but the most 

important one is money. 
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For some families, it is just impossible to survive on only one income; 

however, you do not have to. If you are interested in becoming a stay 

at home mom, you can do so while generating income at the same 

time. This can be done by acquiring the resell rights to a software 

program. 

 

At any given time, there are a number of software developers and 

designers who are working on creating a new product. Once that 

product has been created, the selling process should begin. 

 

The problem that many software developers and designers face is that 

they do not know how to go about selling their products. Instead of 

taking the time to learn how, they rely on someone else to do the 

selling for them. 

 

If you think that this sounds like a commission-based program, you 

are wrong. 

 

Before allowing an individual, someone just like you, to sell their 

products, most software designers and developers require that their 

products be purchased.  Instead of purchasing the whole product, you 

are purchasing the right to resell it. 

 

After that transaction has occurred, you can do just about whatever 

you want to the software program. This not only includes selling it, but 

altering it to become something more. 

 

In fact, many stay at home moms, who participate in this type of 

opportunity, decide to alter the software in some way. Doing so often 

allows them to claim the program as their own.   

 

To make money from the software program, which you acquired the 

resell rights to; you will need to start selling that program. This selling 

is why this is the perfect opportunity for you and other stay at home 

moms. You can sell your software program at your own pace. 
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In fact, you can do as much work or as little work as you wish. The 

decision is completely yours to make. However, it is important to 

remember that the more work you do, the more money you will make. 

 

When it comes to selling private label software, the good news is that 

you have a number of different selling options. These options may 

include, but should not be limited to, the creation of a product website, 

the use of online auction websites, or the use of online classified ads.  

 

Like the business opportunity as a whole, these selling methods are 

ideal for those who are stay at home moms. Many of the above-

mentioned selling methods do not require a large amount of work. 

 

In fact, a few hours a week may be more than an enough time to get 

your website started, submit online classified ads, or start an auction 

on an online auction website.   

 

If you are interested in further examining private label resell rights, 

you are encouraged to do so. There are a number of online resource 

guides that should be able to offer your assistance. 

 

In addition to these guides, you are urged to examine what other 

software sellers are offering. Doing so may enable you to estimate 

how much money you can make by reselling a private label software 

program. 
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Chapter 7: Choosing a PLR 
Product To Sell 

____________________________________ 

 

 
 
Millions of Americans are currently trying to make money 

online. Unfortunately, many of them are not making money, but 

losing it. 
 

If you are interested in taking part an online business opportunity, no 
matter what that opportunity be, it is advised that you know exactly 

what you are getting into before agreeing to invest your hard-earned 

money or sign a contract. It is one of the few ways that you can 
protect yourself.   

 

When searching for an online business opportunity, there are many 
individuals who come across something that is known as private label 

resell rights. Private label resell rights are offered on a number of 

different products. 
 

With the internet, these products most commonly include software 

programs or e-books. Private label resell rights are when the product 
creator does not have the time, money, or experienced needed to sell 

their finished product. A product creator tends to lose money each day 
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that their product does not sell; therefore, they look for assistance. 
This is where you could come in, if you were looking to make money 

online. 

 
To get their product on the market, while making money at the same 

time, many product creators, such as e-book authors or software 

designers, sell the resell rights to their product. 
 

The amount of money they are selling their rights for will vary; 

however, most resell rights do not cost more than a few hundred 
dollars. If you are able to come up with this money, you could not only 

be helping the product creator make money, but yourself as well.  

 
Since you legally obtained the resell rights to the product in question, 

you can start to profit from each sale that you make.  Unfortunately, it 

is not always as easy as it sounds. 
 

When it comes to purchasing the resell rights to a private label 

product, such as an e-book or software program, there are many 
buyers who make a costly mistake. That mistake is not picking a 

product that sells. 

 
To make money, you cannot just select a random private label 

product, instead you must research the market and learn what 

customers want and need to buy. Doing so will not only allow you to 
obtain the resell rights to a product that will sell, but one that will be in 

high demand.   

 
The best way to learn about products, topics, or issues that are 

currently popular on the internet is to use the internet. You may also 
want to actively participate in online discussions. You can easily do this 

by joining a number of different message boards. 

 
With online message boards, many internet users post important 

questions and product requests. If you are able to find a product, such 

as a specific software program or e-book, that is being requested on a 
large scale, that product may be able to turn you a profit.  

 

In addition to using the internet, you are advised to always keep your 
eyes and ears open. You never know what or where you will learn 

something new. Reading the news and participating in online message 
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board discussions are just a few of the many ways that you can go 
about researching the need for a particular product. This research may 

seem time consuming; however, it is necessarily, that is unless what 

don’t mind losing the money you invested. 
 

 

Writers, Make Money by Creating and Selling PLR 

Articles 
 
Are you a freelance writer looking for work? In the United States, there 

are thousands, if not millions, of individuals who are making a career 

as a freelance writer. 
 

The only problem with this is that there are a limited number of 

money-making opportunities. As the internet has increased in 
popularity, so have the number of ways that clients are able to obtain 

content for their websites. If you find yourself looking for ways to pay 

your bills, you may want to examine private label articles and what 
they can do for you. 

 

When you create private label articles, you will not need to have a 
client.  Instead of being told what to write, you can write on any topic 

that you desire. However, as you are most likely already aware of, it is 

best to write articles on popular topics. 
 

Website owners are the most common buyers of content articles. This 

is because original content may help to increase their search engine 
rankings, increase their website’s visitor count, and make their website 

more interesting. 

 
In most cases, website owners only purchase content that is popular at 

the moment. That is why it is a good idea to make sure you are writing 

marketable articles. 
 

Traditionally, after you write your own articles, you will begin 

searching for a buyer. If you have already tried selling your articles 
this way, you are probably aware that it is not as easy as it sounds.  

Finding buyers will not only take time, but it may also take money. 
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In the past, if you didn’t have time or money you would be out of luck. 
Now, you can allow others to sell your content for you. This is done by 

making the private label resell rights to your content available for 

purchase.   
 

With private label resell rights, someone will buy the resell rights to 

your articles, often in large quantities. It will then be their 
responsibility to market and sell them. Depending on the agreement 

you and the buyer make, the buyer may be able to claim the content 

as their own. 
 

In addition to claiming your content, they may also be able to alter it. 

If you do not want your content altered, you will just have to outline it 
as a stipulation in the user agreement. 

 

When offering your article rights up for sale, your first thought may be 
to keep everything the same, including your name as the author. 

While there are advantages to doing this, it may have an impact on 

how much you are able to sell your resell rights for. 
 

Many buyers prefer purchasing a product, including content articles, 

which they can not only alter, but claim as their own. By allowing this 
to take place, you should be able to charge more money for the resell 

rights.   

 
If you are interested in selling the resell rights to your content, you 

will have to find a prospective buyer. This is often compared to finding 

a buyer for your own articles, but it is often easier. As soon as you 
make your opportunity available, you should begin to see results. 

 
This result will often be inquiring or sample requests. If a prospective 

buyer is pleased with what they see, they may agree to purchase the 

private label resell rights to your content; thus, ending your 
responsibility.   

 

If you are unsure about this unique money-making opportunity, you 
may want to, at least, give it a try. If you are unable to sell the rights 

to your private label articles you can then return to what you were 

doing before. 
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If you do find success, as many writers have, you don’t have to stop 
there. You could continue to write content articles only to sell their 

resell rights. In fact, if you had a successful relationship with a 

previous buyer, there is a good chance that the buyer may return for 
more of your handcrafted articles. 

 

 

Writers, Make Money with PLR Ebooks 
 

In the past, whenever a reader wanted to pick up a book they often 

went to their local library or book store. Now, more readers are getting 

their books online. These books are being marketed as e-books. 

 

E-books come in a format that is easy to read off of the computer, but 
they can also be printed. If you are an experienced writer, you may be 

able to make money by creating your own e-books. 

 
If you are interested in taking part in this money-making opportunity, 

you will first have to find a topic that will inspire readers to purchase 

your material. This can easily be done by using the internet. 
 

You will want to look for popular topics that are being discussed online. 

It may also be a good idea to see if any e-books are already available, 
especially those with the topic that you intend to write on. 

 

You can still write an e-book on a popular topic, even one with 
numerous e-books already available; however, it may be more difficult 

to sell your completed e-book. 

 
After you have found a topic and completed writing, you will then have 

to make an important decision. This decision may not only have an 

impact on how much money you make, but how much work additional 

work will be required. 

 

That decision is whether you want to sell your own e-book or have 
someone else do it for you. As you may assume, there are a number 

of advantages and disadvantage to each. To select the best option, 

you are advised to fully examine the advantages and disadvantages.  
Doing so will allow you to make a more informed decision. 
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If you decide to sell your own e-book, you will find that it not only 
takes time, but money as well. Customers cannot purchase your e-

book if they do not know that you have created one. For this reason, 

you will have to effectively market your e-book. 
 

This may involve the creation of a website and multiple informational 

articles. You will need money to design and develop your own website. 
 

If you are unfamiliar with web design, you may even need to hire the 

services of a professional website developer. If time and money is 
something that you do not have, you may want to examine private 

label resell rights. 

 
Private label resell rights are how many individuals are making money 

nowadays. If you make the decision to have someone else sell your 

creation, you may want to take this route. 
 

In a way, you will be giving away your e-book, for a fee of course. The 

person who purchases the resell rights to your e-book will then be able 
to sell it to the general public. This person will likely to be experienced 

in product advertisement. In addition to being experienced, these 

individuals are will likely have the time to market your e-book, 
whereas you might not. 

 

When it comes to offering your e-book resell rights for sale, you will 
have a number of different options. There are many authors who allow 

their resell rights purchaser to alter their material and then claim the 

creation rights; however, this is not always the case. 
 

By creating your own contract or user agreement, you should be able 
to stipulate what you want and do not want done with your e-book. 

 

 
The individuals who purchase the right to resell your e-book will make 

an unspecified amount of money off the sale.  Many times, the amount 

of money they make will depend on how much work they put into 
marketing the e-book. 

 

While you may be interested in pocketing this money yourself, it is 
important to understand how resell rights work. When offering your e-

book resell rights for sale, you can put any price tag on it that you 
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would like. This means that that you can control how much money you 
make.   

 

If you are interested in creating e-books for the purpose of offering 
private label resell rights, you are urged to start examining your 

options. 

 
As the popularity of private label resell rights increases, you may soon 

find that so does the competition. To make money off of this 

opportunity, you are encouraged to act fast before someone else 
creates an e-book just like yours. 
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Conclusion 

____________________________________ 

 

 
 

Each year, millions of people think about working from home. 

 

Many of those individuals are either stay at home parents, retired, or 

disabled.  Working from home allows many individuals, who otherwise 

would be unemployed, to generate an income. 

 

While the previously mentioned individuals most commonly work from 

home, you do not have to fall into one of those categories to be a 

home worker. If fact, if you just feel like working from home, you can. 

 

One of the many reasons why working from home has increased in 

popularity is due to the limited number of expenses. When you think 

about it, the cost of working a traditional job can easily add up. 

 

You may not give it any thought, but, in a way, your gasoline, travel 

time, food away from home, and drinks away from home, can all be 

considered extra expenses. This is because if you were working from 

home, you wouldn’t necessarily have to pay them. That is why a large 
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number of everyday individuals, just like you, are making the switch to 

business opportunities that allow them to work from home. 

 

If you are interested in joining the growing number of individuals who 

work from home, you will need to find a work at home job or a work at 

home business opportunity. A work at home job is similar to most 

traditional jobs. 

 

With a work at home job, you will still be working for someone else, 

but you will be working from the comfort of your own home. A work at 

home businesses opportunity will not only allow you to work from 

home, but it will also allow you to be your own boss. 

 

If given the choice, many individuals would prefer to find a money-

making business opportunity versus a job.  If this is the case, you are 

advised to start reviewing all of the opportunities that are out there. 

 

In your search for a money-making business opportunity, it is likely 

that you will come across an opportunity which offers you the private 

label rights to a particular product.  

 

Those products may include, but should not be limited to, e-books, 

mass collection of content articles, or software programs. Some of the 

best offers include ones that offer the resell rights for e-books. 

 

This is because the popularity of e-books is rapidly increasing. Instead 

of borrowing a book from the library or buying a new book, many 

individuals are reading books that come in the form of an e-book. 

 

With this business opportunity, you will need to find an individual or 

company that is offering their e-book resell rights for sale. When 

searching for e-book resell rights, it is advised that you examine a 

number of different offers. 

 

You will find that these offers tend to vary from person to person. 

Once you found an e-book, that you feel will be easy to sell, you need 

to inquire about purchasing the private label resell rights. Depending 
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on who you are doing business with, this cost may be high; however, 

it is important to keep in mind what you are getting.   

 

Individuals that are placing their e-book resell rights on the market are 

mostly likely the original author of the e-book. This gives them the 

ability to place restrictions on the reselling that you are allowed to do.  

 

If these restrictions exist, they should be outlined before you agree to 

do business. Depending on what these restrictions are, they may have 

a positive or negative effect on your ability to sell the e-book.   

 

Common restrictions include advertising methods, the altering of 

materials, or author rights. In many cases, you are not only able to 

sell the e-book, but change a portion of it and then claim it as your 

own, but this is not always the case. 

 

As you can see there are a number of important factors that must be 

examined when it comes to obtaining the resell rights to a well written 

e-book. 

 

If you are interested in this business opportunity, you are encouraged 

to familiarize yourself with it before making any final arrangements.  

 

After your examination, you may very well find that this opportunity 

will not only allow you to quit your job, but cut back on your weekly 

expenses.   
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